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St.Geo rge Emilie Pinkelman <emilie.pinkelman@sgcity.org>

GHTER SIDE

Re: Application Status - Pride Festival on 11/7/20

1 message

Emilie Pinkelman <emilie.pinkelman@sgcity.org> Fri, Aug 14, 2020 at 3:53 PM
To: Stephen Lambert <stephen@prideofsouthernutah.org>

Hi Stephen,

I'm sorry to hear that but understand completely.
I will notify our park reservation office of the cancellation on 11/7/20.

Do you know what your date will be for next year?

Thank you,
Emilie Pinkelman
Special Events License Specialist

L

175 East 200 North | St. George, UT 84770

(435) 627-4712 phone | (435) 627-4430 fax

D4 emilie.pinkelman@sgcity.org
www.sgcity.org/SpecialEvent | www.sgcity.org/SignPermit

On Fri, Aug 14, 2020 at 3:49 PM Stephen Lambert <stephen@prideofsouthernutah.org> wrote:
Happy Friday Emilie,

Thank you for your email. We have made the tough decision, that with everything going on, we are not going to move
forward with our festival this year.

Do | need to call the parks to release the park, or is that something you do?
Thank you! Stay healthly
Stephen

On Tue, Aug 4, 2020 at 12:09 PM Emilie Pinkelman <emilie.pinkelman@sgcity.org> wrote:
Hi Stephen,

RE: Pride Festival on 11/7/20

I hope you are healthy and doing well! I'm touching base with all my permit applicants through the rest of this year,
to see how they are planning to proceed during the pandemic.

Are you still planning to hold your festival in Town Square on November 7th? If so, I'll need your COVID-19 Event
Plan in addition to your Permit Application so they can be reviewed by our committee.

If you are also planning to do any separate events like a family picnic or after-party, I'll need the COVID Plan &
Application for each of those as well, because they will be issued under 3 separate permit numbers.

Please let me know if you have any questions.
Thank you,

Emilie Pinkelman
Special Events License Specialist
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175 East 200 North | St. George, UT 84770

(435) 627-4712 phone | (435) 627-4430 fax

< emilie.pinkelman@sgcity.org
www.sgcity.org/SpecialEvent | www.sgcity.org/SignPermit

On Thu, Apr 9, 2020 at 9:28 AM Emilie Pinkelman <emilie.pinkelman@sgcity.org> wrote:
Good Morning Stephen,

RE: Pride Festival on 11/7/20

Now that we have your date confirmed, please send your Special Event Permit Application package to me so it
can be reviewed by our committee.

As a concession for moving your event at the very last minute in 2019, the City agreed in 2020 to only charging
you $400 to reserve Town Square (instead of the standard $150 per hour rate). According to my notes, all other
concessions were satisfied in 2019 and do not carry over into 2020.

In addition to your $150 Special Event Permit Fee, please also remember to collect a $5 Sub-Licensing Fee from
each of your vendors, so you can remit the total due via one check immediately after the event. Most event
planners collect this fee as part of their vendor booth fee.

If you are planning to host a Family Picnic again this year, you'll need to get that location reserved and submit a
separate Special Event Permit Application for it as well.
The same goes for an After-Party event.

If you have questions about any of this, please let me know. &)
P.S. We will remove you from our reservation list on 9/26/20.

Thank you,
Emilie Pinkelman
Special Events License Specialist

P

175 East 200 North | St. George, UT 84770
(435) 627-4712 phone | (435) 627-4430 fax

< emilie.pinkelman@sgcity.org
www.sgcity.org/SpecialEvent | www.sgcity.org/SignPermit

Disclaimer: The information contained in this e-mail is legally privileged and/or confidential information intended only for the receipt by and
use of the individual or entity to whom or which it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any
dissemination, distribution, or copying of this message is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately
notify the sender and delete this message from your computer. Thank you.

Stephen Lambert
Director, Pride of Southern Utah
prideofsouthernutah.org
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